JUDICIAL SALE — APRIL 28, 2022

REGISTRATION FOR THIS SALE HAS CLOSED

NOTICE OF THE LUZERNE COUNTY
TAX CLAIM BUREAU

*** ALL ATTENDEES OF ANY EVENT HELD BY ELITE REVENUE SOLUTIONS,
LLC, WILL BE REQUIRED TO WEAR A MASK COVERING THEIR MOUTH AND
NOSE AT ALL TIMES WHILE INDOORS, ONLY REGISTERED BIDDERS WILL BE
PERMITTED TO ATTEND THIS TAX SALE. ANYONE NOT ADHERING TO THESE
POLICIES WILL BE ASKED TO LEAVE. ***

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that Elite Revenue Solutions, LLC as agent for the Luzerne
County Tax Claim Bureau will hold a JUDICIAL SALE under the Pennsylvania Real Estate Tax
Law of 1947, as amended, commencing 10:00 A.M. the 28th day of April, 2022 at auxiliary
gymnasium at the King’s College Scandlon Physical Education Center, 150 N. Main Street,
Wilkes-Barre, Pennsylvania. The properties exposed to sale will be sold Free & Clear of all tax
and municipal claims, mortgages, liens, charges and estates of whatsoever kind, except ground
rents separately taxed.

IT IS STRONGLY URGED that prospective purchasers have an examination made of the
title to any property in which they may be interested. Every reasonable effort has been made to
keep the proceedings free from error. However, in every case the Tax Claim Bureau is selling the
TAXABLE INTEREST and the property is offered for sale by the Tax Claim Bureau without
guarantee of warranty whatever, either as to structure or lack of structures upon the land.

There will be NO REDEMPTION PERIOD after the date of the sale, but these Taxes and
Costs can be paid up to the time of the sale.

Prospective purchasers at all tax sales are required to certify as follows:

1. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a
successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person
is not delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne
County, nor is the bidder acting on behalf of another individual or entity who is
delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County; and

2. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a
successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person
is not delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne
County, nor is the bidder acting on behalf of another individual or entity who is
delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne
County.



3. Pursuant to Section 601 (d) of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.601 (d),
prospective bidders must certify that they have not had a landlord license revoked in any
municipality in Luzerne County and that they are not acting as an agent for a person
whose landlord license has been revoked.

In accordance with Section 618 of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.618, the
owner shall not be permitted to repurchase said property.

TERMS OF SALE: Payment of the bid price along with transfer taxes and recording
costs shall be due and owing as soon as the sale is completed and must be made in the form
of cash, certified check, or money order. In the event that said amount is not paid before the
close of business on the day of the sale, the sale will be voided and the bidder will not be permitted
to bid on any properties in future sales.

In the event that a successful bidder tenders a bad check to the Tax Claim Bureau when
purchasing a property in any sale the bidder shall not be permitted to bid on any properties in future
sales and the matter shall be referred to the Luzerne County District Attorney’s Office for
prosecution under the Pennsylvania Crimes Code, 18 Pa. C.S.A. § 4105 which may lead to a
CONVICTION OF A FELONY OF THE THIRD DEGREE.

Prospective bidders must register prior to the sale. DUE TO NEW LEGISLATION
PASSED ON JUNE 25, 2021 AND EFFECTIVE AUGUST 29, 2021, IN THE STATE OF
PENNSYLVANIA, REGISTRATION MUST BE COMPLETED IN PERSON AND NO
LESS THAN TEN DAYS PRIOR TO EACH TAX SALE. THEREFORE, ALL
REGISTRATION MUST BE COMPLETED WITH THE BUREAU NO LATER THAN
4:00 PM ON APRIL 14, 2022. Registration and Certification forms are available in the Tax Claim
Bureau and online at www.luzernecountytaxclaim.com. All Prospective Bidders must present one
(1) form of photo identification at the time of registration and on the date of the Sale. Failure to
present photo identification at the time of registration will prevent a Prospective Bidder from being
registered to bid. Failure to present photo identification on the date of the sale will prevent the
bidder from receiving his bidder number and thus barring the registered bidder from having the
opportunity to bid on property.

Any person whose property is included in the list and being exposed to Public Sale, who
believes that by no reason of some defect said property should not be exposed to sale, should
immediately make known their reason to the Tax Claim Bureau, either in person or by agent.

The County of Luzerne does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin,
sex, religion, age, disability or familial status in employment or the provision of services.

Any questions regarding the Judicial Sale should be directed to the Luzerne County Tax
Claim Bureau at (570) 825-1512.

Elite Revenue Solutions, LLC
Agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau
Sean P. Shamany, Director



Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 23, 2021 upon
delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2019 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised
in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 20, 2021.
Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 24, 2020 upon delinquent
tax claims filed for the tax years 2018 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The
Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 14, 2020. Petitioner
exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 26, 2019 upon delinquent tax claims
filed for the tax years 2017 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader,
Standard Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 23, 2019. Petitioner exposed certain
parcels of land to Upset Sale on September 27, 2018 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax
years 2016 inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard
Speaker and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 17, 2018. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of
land to Upset Sale on September 28, 2017 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2015
inter alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the
Luzerne Legal Register on August 18, 2017. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset
Sale on September 20, 2016 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2014 inter alia.
Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the Luzerne
Legal Register on August 19, 2016. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to Upset Sale
September 24, 2015 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2013 inter alia. Notice of
the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader and Standard Speaker on August 21, 2015,
and the Luzerne Legal Register on August 8, 2015. Petitioner exposed certain parcels of land to
Upset Sale on September 12, 2013 upon delinquent tax claims filed for the tax years 2011 inter
alia. Notice of the Upset Sale was advertised in The Times Leader, Standard Speaker and the
Luzerne Legal Register on August 16, 2013.

An upset price was set for each such parcel exposed to sale, in accordance with the Act,
however the following properties were not sold at the respective Upset Sales, because the upset
sale price was not obtained:



4/28/22 JUDICIAL SALE

1 | SALE # MUNICIPALITY PARCEL OWNER PROPERTY DESCRIPTION STARTING BID SALE RESULTS

2 |48-8856 ASHLEY-BOROWARD3 O1-JONET-011-039-000 DOMYANIJAMES )-SR & SUSAN 84-S-MAIN-ST $1,223.71 REMOVED - TAXES PAID

3 |20-0043 |ASHLEY BORO WARD 3 01-J9NE1 -010-25A-000 CARLO STEPHANIE MARIE 142 S MAIN ST $1,385.79 SOLD $22,000 BIDDER # 159
4 [20-0112 |BLACK CREEK TWP 03-U5S2 -006-013-000 MWAURA LAWRENCE K 120 CONYNGHAM RD $1,435.77 SOLD $4,500 BIDDER # 141

5 [19-0180 BEAR CREEK TWP 04-K13S1 -004-009-000 GRIFFITH LEAH & ELIZABETH, BOTH DECEASED BEAR CREEK BLVD $2,654.56 SOLD $2,654.56 BIDDER # 253
6 |20-0156 |BEAR CREEK TWP 04-K1254 -004-003-000 KALOMIRIS ANASTASIOS LAURELBROOK DR $1,702.96 SOLD $8,000 BIDDER # 315

7 |20-0209 |BUTLER TWP WARD 1 06-S7 -00A-003-000 JEC LAND TRUST REAR FAITH DR $1,536.32 SOLD $1,536.32 BIDDEDR # 253
8 [19-0247 |BUTLER TWP WARD 2 06-Q8512 -005-016-000 ZOVKO ZORAN SNOW VALLEY DR $1,508.24 SOLD $1,508.24 BIDDER # 243
9 |20-0224 \BUTLER TWP WARD 2 06-Q8S9 -007-002-000 PHILLIPS GILES TOMMYS CT $1,522.81 SOLD $1,522.81 BIDDER # 293
10(20-0226 |BUTLER TWP WARD 2 06-Q9S2 -002-015-000 THOMAS JOHN P & KARIN E FOUR SEASONS DR $1,789.01 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
11120-0248 |CONYNGHAM BORO 08-S6 -00A-34A-000 ALVAREZ ROXANA BROOK HILL RD $1,205.07 SOLD $1,205.07 BIDDER # 253
12120-0245 |COURTDALE BORO 07-G9S2 -002-011-000 SHIELDS JOHN 21 HARRINGTON ST $1,179.45 SOLD $29,000 BIDDER # 145
13119-0295 |CONYNGHAM TWP 09-M5S1 -002-013-000 BURLEIGH JAMES & KIMBERLY ANN LILLY POND RD $1,967.35 SOLD $1,967.35 BIDDER # 497
14119-0361 |DALLAS TWP 10-D8S9 -002-10A-000 HAMAD RAED M & MARY JO LINCOLN STREET $1,809.89 SOLD $3,500 BIDDER # 261
15119-0371 |DALLAS TWP 10-E8S2 -004-006-000 SMITH ELAINE L J ETAL BROOK ST $2,067.20 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
16 |19-0353 |DALLAS TWP 10-D8-T03-084-000 KITTLE, CHARLES, deceased 84 DALLAS PARK $1,809.06 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
17 |120-0288 |DALLAS TWP 10-C7 -T01-020-000 GRAY ELIZABETH 20 COUNTY PINE TRAILER CT $1,319.75 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
18 120-0364 | DORRANCE TWP 12-N7 -00A-15J-000 BALDASSANO ROBERT & LINDSAY ALBERDEEN RD $1,733.29 SOLD $4,000 BIDDER # 409
19120-0372 |DORRANCE TWP 12-07 -00A-58K-000 GITTENS LINDA AND GARY OFF BLUE RIDGE RD $1,635.60 SOLD $2,500 BIDDER # 436
20(20-0377 |DENNISON TWP 13-N10S2 -003-006-000 GIORDANO FRANK SR JOANNE LN $1,626.59 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
21|20-0400 [DURYEA BORO WARD 2 14-D12NW2-001-011-000 |RYZNER ANN 519 WATT ST $1,700.80 SOLD $47,000 BIDDER # 305
22 (19-0452 |DURYEA BORO WARD 3 14-D12S1 -001-12D-000 CONTE KIMBERLY FOOTE AVE $1,578.45 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
23(16-0417 [DUPONT BOROUGH 15-E12NE3-001-004-000 SITNICK, EDWARD A. 221 EVERHART ST $2,913.75 SOLD $60,000 BIDDER # 12
24 (20-0483 |EXETER BORO WARD 3 16-E11NW4-005-028-000 |JANISZEWSKI LEONARD + JOSEPHINE 159 LINCOLN ST $1,422.01 SOLD $15,000 BIDDER #225
25(19-0553 [EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-E10 -00A-015-005 MICHAELS SEAN & MICHELLE L 163 BIRCHWOOD EST $1,740.20 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
26 (16-0450 EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-D10-T02-008-000 SUDOSKI TONY 8 MT LOOKOUT TRL CT $2,177.92 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
27 (20-0504 EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-E10 -00A-015-157 GOBLE JOSEPH 258 BIRCHWOOD EST $1,303.09 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
28 (20-0524 EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-E11NW4-020-001-000 |PACE JOSEPH & MONICA 176 SCHOOLEY ST $1,574.84 SOLD $16,000 BIDDER # 283
29 (20-0505 EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-E10 -00A-015-204 WATKINS CLARA 186 BIRCHWOOD EST $1,558.44 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
30(20-0514 |EXETER BORO WARD 4 16-E10 -T01-218-000 RHOADES LOIS 218 BIRCHWOOD EST $1,691.24 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
31(20-0530 EXETER TWP 17-B10 -00A-19A-000 BERTZ JOHN 566 LEWIS RD $1,331.77 SOLD $10,000 BIDDER #448
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32(20-0537 |EXETER TWP 17-B10S3 -001-03A-000 HECK JOYCE REDMOND SUTTON CREEK RD $1,318.23 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
33(20-0543 |EXETER TWP 17-C11 -00A-41K-000 LAVELLE PAULJ 257 JOHNS RD $1,407.43 SOLD $6,000 BIDDER # 157
34 (20-0565 |[EDWARDSVILLE WARD 2 18-G9S2 -013-24B-000 DEITZ MATTHEW C & HELEN 3 TOBIN LN $1,449.32 SOLD $17,000 BIDDER # 456
35(20-0584 |[EDWARDSVILLE WARD 5 18-G9S1 -006-027-000 RAMIZA RUTH ANN 33 ARMSTRONG ST $2,190.99 SOLD $17,000 BIDDER # 174
36 (18-0829 |FOSTER TWP 23-R9NE2-008-11A-000 BRANDEAUX GRANT 409 PARK ST $1,777.22 SOLD $11,500 BIDDER # 159
37(20-0727 |FOSTER TWP 23-Q11S6 -006-028-000 BRENNAN COLLETTE 1279 WOODHAVEN DR $1,342.13 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
38(20-0729 |FOSTER TWP 23-Q11S6 -013-009-000 CASTELLUCCI CHARLES N & FLORENCE N LEISURE LN $1,628.86 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
39(20-0722 |FOSTER TWP 23-Q11S2 -002-022-000 TRONCONE EUGENE G HICKORY HILLS DR $1,412.13 SOLD $1,412.13 BIDDER # 430
40 |20-0736 FOSTER TWP 23-Q11S8 -004-021-000 TRONCONE EUGENE G WOODHAVEN DR $1,412.13 SOLD $1,412.13 BIDDER # 417
41(20-0798 | HANOVER TWP WARD 1 25-1851 -004-020-000 KENNEDY ROBERT & EMILY 156 PARK ST $1,681.71 SOLD $1,681.71 BIDDER # 418
42 (19-4089 |HANOVER TWP WARD 2 25-19SE1-008-038-000 SCHAFFER DARLENE 281 RIDGE ST $1,987.57 SOLD $49,000 BIDDER # 496
43 (19-0901 |HANOVER TWP WARD 4 25-19NW2-002-027-000 RAMSEY, JOHN F. & JEAN M. 42 DEXTER ST $1,477.34 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
44 (18-0923 |HANOVER TWP WARD 5 25-18NE3-006-019-000 VARGAS, CARLOE & KRYSTYNA 3 FERRYRD $3,524.55 SOLD $29,000 BIDDER#9
45(20-0915 |HANOVER TWP WARD 7 25-19NW3 -009-015-000 KELLER JENNIFER & WILLIAM 37 KNOX ST $1,909.99 SOLD $62,000 BIDDER # 451
46 (19-4092 |HAZLE TWP WARD 1 26-5953-002-012-000 ROJAS, TOMAS 1977 ROUTE 940 HWY $1,524.01 SOLD $3,500 BIDDER # 303
47 (20-0989 |HAZLE TWP WARD 1 26-59S5 -001-011-000 GROSS CHARLES L JR 19 W OAKDALE $2,146.97 SOLD $15,500 BIDDER #300
48 (20-0936 |HAZLE TWP WARD 1 26-R9S1 -002-004-000 REED VINCENT & AGNES 82 FIRST ST $1,647.24 SOLD $14,500 BIDDER #403
49 (20-0933 |HAZLE TWP WARD 1 26-R8S2 -003-010-000 ROSARIO JESUS & AIDA LUZ 229 PARDEESVILLE RD $1,551.01 SOLD $4,500 BIDDER # 299
50 (21-3875 |HAZLE TWP WARD 1 26-S8-00A-31B-000 GUS GENETTI'S HOTEL & RESTAURANT INC HARLEIGH LATTIMER $1,379.17 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
51(20-0941 HAZLE TWP WARD 1 26-57-00A-028-000 ALL-PRO AIRPORT ROAD LP [NO LOCATION] $1,299.01 SOLD $50,000 BIDDER # 254
52(19-1202 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S514 -001-315-000 CAMPOS CANDIDO AND REMEDIOS & CAMELLIA LN $2,274.33 SOLD $2,274.33 BIDDER # 141
53(19-1234 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S515 -001-496-000 LEE JUNG KYU AND YOUNG SOO SCOTS PINE LN $1,912.39 SOLD $6,500 BIDDER #141
54(19-1213 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S514 -001-472-000 MAGPANTAY BIENVENIDO L AND NENITA WHITE OAK LANE $1,670.10 SOLD $2,500 BIDDER # 141
55({19-1196 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S514 -001-155-000 MONTEMAYOR JODITO C & THELMINA A MAPLE LN $1,800.69 SOLD $2,000 BIDDER # 141
56 |18-1069 HAZLLETWRIWARD 2 26-1552-001-032-000 HZAOLING- & LIREN-LIY {NO-LOCAHON] $2,287.-10 REMOVED - TAXES PAID

57 (18-3289 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T551-001-615-000 SHEDLESKI KENNETH A & RAEANN M APPALACHIAN WAY $2,105.63 SOLD $2,105.63 BIDDER # 141
58 (20-1191 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S8 -002-001-000 ALVAREZ ROXANA 267 TURNBERRY LN $1,710.92 SOLD $5,000 BIDDER # 141
59 |20-10/76 |HAZLETWPR-WARD-2 26-U5510-007-348-000 BAILEY-PHILIP D & LINDA-A LtAUREL VLY $1,703.47 REMOVED - TAXES PAID

60 ({20-1006 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T5S1 -001-347-000 CADIRGAMANATHAN JANAKAN & THUSHANTY BLUE MTN DRIVE NORTH $1,335.48 SOLD $1,335.48 BIDDER # 141
61({20-1110 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S514 -001-154-000 DELA CRUZ RONIETTO L & LUCITAE MAPLE LN $1,563.92 SOLD $2,500 BIDDER # 141
62 (20-1117 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S514 -001-291-000 DIO MARIA JOSENA RAMOS MAPLE LN $1,401.20 SOLD $4,000 BIDDER # 27
63(20-1012 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T5S1 -001-506-000 GUO SONGTAO & XIAOQIU ZHANG MOUNTAINVIEW DRIVE $1,411.01 SOLD $1,411.01 BIDDER # 141
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64 (20-1051 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T8S2 -001-038-000 HK PARTNERS SUNSET BLVD $1,358.64 SOLD $1,358.64 BIDDER # 181
65(20-1053 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T8S2 -001-049-000 HK PARTNERS SUNSET BLVD $1,350.74 SOLD $7,500 BIDDER # 181
66 [20-1054 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T8S2 -001-050-000 HK PARTNERS SUNSET BLVD $1,345.62 SOLD - $6,000 BIDDER # 181
67 ({20-1055 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T8S2 -001-051-000 HK PARTNERS SUNSET BLVD $1,343.27 SOLD $15,000 BIDDER #477
68 (20-1011 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-T5S1 -001-470-000 JUN CHEN XIAO ROCK CREST DRIVE $1,420.87 SOLD $5,000 BIDDER # 252
69 |20-1017 HAZLETWRWARD 2 26-F551-001-642-000 KEIYORO-PETER NJENGA- & NYCEK $1,473-30 REMOVED - TAXES PAID

70 |20-1187 HAZLETWRWARD 2 26-U557-006-011-088 KHAYKO RAFAELIR & APRI& 168-CHINOOKDR $1,641:10 REMOVED - TAXES PAID
71(20-1068 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S510 -002-201-000 MANULAT EMELITA LAUREL VALLEY RD $1,469.78 SOLD $3,500 BIDDER # 141
72 |20-1405 HAZLETWRWARD 2 26-U5513-001-364-000 NARVADEZ NEKIE & MARITA LOT364-THEVASTAS $1,614.01 REMOVED - TAXES PAID

73 |20-1140 |HAZLETWP-WARD-2 26-U5515-001-394-000 MANGA-MARILYN-A HHONEYSUCKLE-DRIVE $1,398.59 REMOVED - TAXES PAID

74 |20-1163 HAZLLETWRWARD 2 26-U555-006-013-000 ORGO-OSWALD PINEVALLEY LN $1,448:43 REMOVED - TAXES PAID
75(20-1103 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S513 -001-329-000 REID CHARLES J LOT 329 THE VISTAS $1,462.31 SOLD $1,462.31 BIDDER # 141
76 |20-1114 |HAZLETWP-WARD2 26-U5514-001-243-000 SANG-EMMANUELK ALDEN-LN $1,630-41 REMOVED - TAXES PAID

77 |20-1005 |HAZLETWPR-WARD-2 26-F551-001-328-000 URPAL-MANHT LOCUSTLANE $1,625:35 REMOVED - TAXES PAID

78 (20-1129 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S515 -001-052-000 WANG CUUIE SWEET BIRCH LN $1,502.03 SOLD $1,502.03 BIDDER # 141
79 (19-1293 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U754 -014-013-000 KAPUSCHINSKY RONALD 879 OLD ST $1,924.49 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
80(19-1298 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U8 -00A-00A-000 BROADCASTERS 7 INC HILLTOP RD $1,625.66 SOLD $1,625.66 BIDDER # 201
81(18-1222 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S59-001-058-000 BRADOKA JOHN SCOTT & ROBERT H LITTNER LITTLE LEAF CT $1,790.07 SOLD $2,500 BIDDER # 141
82(19-1142 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S510 -001-042-000 AFANTE JEAN R & MARIO D JR MOUNTAIN LAUREL DR $1,991.73 SOLD $4,000 BIDDER # 252
83(19-1300 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U8S3 -004-004-000 MILLER JANET & GEORGE, both deceased 250 HOPE ST $2,770.73 SOLD $30,000 BIDDER # 480
34 |19-1089 HAZLLETWRWARD 2 26-1551-001-269-000 SANTFOSJULLILET-M-&-SIMON-KAGONDY BUCK-MOUNTAIN-BLVD $449.69 REMOVED - TAXES PAID
85(19-1175 |HAZLE TWP WARD 2 26-U5S513 -001-066-000 LLORENTE MARIA SASSAFRASS LN $332.37 SOLD $3,000 BIDDER # 141
86 (20-1246 | HUGHESTOWN BORO 28-E12NW1-004-035-000 |OLIVERI LEONARD 8 HUGHES ST $1,482.04 SOLD $10,500 BIDDER # 290
87(18-1286 |HUNLOCK TWP 29-H5-00A-28U-000 TAMMAC HOLDINGS CORPORATION 199 VALLEY VIEW DR $1,834.67 SOLD $6,000 BIDDER # 242
88(20-1332 |JENKINS TWP 33-E11S51 -002-002-000 HJERPE JOE R JR & INGRID SHEILA 1107 S MAIN ST $1,765.01 SOLD $12,500 BIDDER # 240
89 (18-1440 |[KINGSTON BORO WARD 4 34-G9NE3-005-008-000 BARROW BERNIE 138 W WALNUT ST $1,269.86 SOLD $7,500 BIDDER # 464
90 ({19-1567 |KINGSTON BORO WARD 7 34-H9NE2-016-013-000 ARMICIDA, MICHAEL F. 351 CHESTER ST $1,357.51 SOLD $10,500 BIDDER # 208
91(17-1552 |[KINGSTON BORO WARD 7 34-H9NE1-011-019-000 KEARNEY JOSEPH 40 S LOVELAND AVE $3,413.58 SOLD $81,000 BIDDER # 284
92 (20-1460 KINGSTON TWP 35-E853-001-005-000 DAVIS WALTER & IDA HALE ST $1,232.61 SOLD $1,232.61 BIDDER # 158
93 (20-1553 |LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 3 38-H8S2 -001-015-000 STINER ETHEL 41 W BROADWAY $1,712.55 SOLD $29,000 BIDDER #173
94 (19-1778 |LEHMAN TWP 40-G6S2 -003-008-000 ROLF HUGH ETAL NORSTEDT LN $2,133.37 SOLD $11,000 BIDDER # 240
95(19-1779 |LEHMAN TWP 40-G6S2 -003-009-000 ROLF HUGH & BETTY LEE FRUSCIANTE NORSTEDT AVE $1,744.33 SOLD $1,744.33 BIDDER # 240
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96 (16-1463 |LUZERNE BORO 41-G9NE2-010-019-000 ALBINA POPE IRREVOCABLE TRUST 347-349 VAUGH ST $3,541.60 SOLD $42,000 BIDDER # 306

97 1817 NANTHCOKECHY WARD1 42--NES-002-13A-000 GROHOWSKIJOHNS LOOMISST $2,:212.50 REMOVED - COURT ORDER

98 (18-1736 |NANTICOKE CITY WARD 4 42-J7NW2-011-006-000 ROBACZEWSKI, MARY aka MARY ROBASHOK, deceased 252 RIVER ST $1,980.56 SOLD $17,000 BIDDER # 449

99 (20-1807 |NANTICOKE CITY WARD 10 42-)7SW2 -005-005-000 TAGNANI FRANK & VILMA M 240 MAPLE ST $2,403.05 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
100{19-1919 |NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11 42-)7SE4 -014-007-000 HAYDOCK FRANK 800 S HANOVER ST $1,811.41 SOLD $18,500 BIDDER # 386
101{19-1994 |NESCOPECK BORO 43-P3SW4 -014-13A-000 |HETLER JOHN W & TAMMY M 313 W FIFTH ST $1,632.98 SOLD $57,000 BIDDER # 495
102(20-1866 |[NESCOPECK TWP 44-P4 -00A-018-000 ALMASHAT ALA MD BERWICK HAZLETON HWY $1,414.07 SOLD $1,414.07 BIDDER # 302
103(20-1901 [NEWPORT TWP WARD 1 46-K7S2 -004-010-000 NEWELL DAVID 87 E KIRMAR AVE $2,367.20 SOLD $28,000 BIDDER # 203
104{19-2065 [NEWPORT TWP WARD 2 46-K6S2 -004-001-000 MINERSVILLE LLC 67 E MAIN ST $2,282.91 SOLD $36,000 BIDDER # 225
105(17-2011 |NEWPORT TWP WARD 2 46-K551-004-006-000 ESTATE PF ROBERT J REPOTSKI & BARBARA LACH NEWPORT ST $2,022.53 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
106/20-1923 |[NEWPORT TWP WARD 2 46-K6S1 -010-005-000 KUCHARIK JOHN 127 NEWPORT ST $1,615.14 SOLD $25,500 BIDDER # 243
107/20-1986 [PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1 48-H8SE2 -006-022-000 ORTEGA ORLANDO 48 PIERCE ST $1,506.30 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
108/19-2092 |PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1 48-H8SE2 -011-009-000 LIVINGSTONE BRIAN G 127 PIERCE ST $846.71 SOLD $35,000 BIDDER # 357
109/19-2114 |PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 3 48-H8SE4 -023-002-000 118 HIGH STREET PLYMOUTH PROPERTIES 118 HIGH ST $1,918.94 SOLD $10,500 BIDDER # 208
110[20-2035 [PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 6 48-H8SW3 -023-014-000 |JOHNSON JACQUELINE L 473 1/2 W SHAWNEE AVE $1,500.71 SOLD $23,000 BIDDER # 186
111{20-2029 [PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 6 48-H8SE4 -020-002-000 MAXWELL JR EDWARD F & ROSINA 301 REAR W SHAWNEE AVE $1,525.72 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
112|19-2178 |PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 11  |48-H8SE1 -002-014-000 STUBBLEBINE HOWARD 35 W WALL ST $1,821.29 SOLD $26,000 BIDDER # 456
113|20-2108 [PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 13 |48-H8SW3 -016-018-000 |ALIYAH HOLDINGS LLC 631 LEE AVE $1,168.16 SOLD $5,000 BIDDER # 142
114/18-2185 [PLYMOUTH TWP 49-1852-002-014-000 OSBORNE LINDA 66 SMITH ROW $1,695.23 SOLD $17,000 BIDDER # 145
115/20-2125 [PLYMOUTH TWP 49-17S1A -001-009-000 105 EAST POPLAR STREET TRUST 105 E POPLAR ST $1,390.77 SOLD $25,000 BIDDER #225
116/19-2233 |PLYMOUTH TWP 49-17S2-012-029-000 BANKOVICH JEFFREY J, deceased 45 ALLAN ST $3,549.98 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
117(19-2246 |PLYMOUTH TWP 49-1753 -02A-004-001 PHILLIPS IRVIN HARVEY ST $1,283.40 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
118|19-2280 RLAINS WP WARD1 50-F105£4-882-009-000 EHOPKA-ANDREW -&IJEAN MITFCHELLST $2,486-57 REMOVED - COURT ORDER
119(20-2193 |PLAINS TWP WARD 2 50-G10NW2-005-010-000 |GEORGETTI RUDY & JENNIE 69 W CAREY ST $2,277.30 SOLD $71,000 BIDDER # 225
120(20-2232 |PLAINS TWP WARD 8 50-G11S3 -001-001-000 MATINAS GERALD T 162 UNION STREET $2,270.99 SOLD $31,000 BIDDER # 225
121(20-2254 |PLAINS TWP WARD 10 50-G11 -T01-015-000 MOSIER THEODORE F 15 EAST MT RIDGE MHP $1,836.11 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
122(18-2060 |PLAINS TWP WARD 10 50-G11-T02-312-000 MARTINSON GEORGE & RENEE SLOAT 312 E MOUNTAIN RIDGE MHP $1,788.34 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
123(19-2476 |ROSS TWP 54-G5 -00A-05C-000 BAKER SAMANTHA, deceased 174 PALL RD $1,872.63 SOLD $5,000 BIDDER # 34
124(21-3936 |SALEM TWP 55-P451-003-014-000 CRAGLE CARLC 158 MAIN ST $1,254.16 SOLD $5,000 BIDDER # 56
125(20-2411 |SALEM TWP 55-P4S51 -003-001-000 MOORE DANIELLE R CENTER ST $1,215.63 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
126(20-2414 |SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1 |56-L4SE1 -004-003-000 EYERLEY CLAYTON W, deceased SEARCH ST $1,976.24 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
127(20-2415 |SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1 |56-L4SE1 -004-004-000 EYERLEY RUTH ANN, deceased & CLAYTON W, deceased |28 SEARCH ST $2,012.67 SOLD $2,012.67 BIDDER # 257
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128(18-2496 |SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 2 |56-L45E1-016-010-000 O'BRIEN GERTRUDE 25 BAER ST $1,411.61 SOLD $4,000 BIDDER # 315
129(18-2501 |SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 3 |56-L4SE1-015-03A-000 ABERNATHY GORDON LEE CREEK ALY $1,584.07 SOLD $7,000 BIDDER # 315
130{19-2607 |SWOYERSVILLE WARD 1 59-F10NW1-003-003-000 |PECHAL DANIEL & DAUGHTREY DONNA 1284 MAIN ST $1,720.49 SOLD $28,000 BIDDER # 404
131{19-2662 |SUGAR NOTCH BORO 60-J9SW1 -005-10B-000 POCKEVICH MICHAEL W MAIN ST $1,367.28 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
132|18-2632 |UNION TWP 61-J4-00A-08B-000 BUSCH CARL J, deceased & STELLA, deceased HARTMAN HILL RD $2,180.61 SOLD $2,180.61 BIDDER # 223
133(19-2695 |[UNION TWP 61-K4-00A-45A-000 CRAGLE CARL C ETAL BILBY HILL RD $1,982.92 SOLD $3,500 BIDDER # 222
134(18-2678 |WEST HAZLETON WARD 2 63-T7NE3-015-23A-000 SAIEVA CHARLES, deceased & ROBERTA, deceased 322 ALLEN ST $2,708.28 SOLD $60,000 BIDDER # 403
135(18-2680 |WEST HAZLETON WARD 2 63-T7SE2-006-024-000 REASON LORETTA 9-11 E OAK ST $1,439.27 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
136(18-2733 |WEST PITTSTON WARD 1 65-D11SE4-019-009-000 BREYMEIER HARRY L, deceased & ROSE ANN, deceased 203 SALEM ST $2,109.38 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
137/18-2800 |WEST WYOMING BORO 66-E10SE2-005-003-000 COX PATRICIA A & JEFFREY P 367-369 W SIXTH ST $2,330.67 SOLD $66,000 BIDDER # 464
138|16-2281 WESTWYOMINGBORO 66-E10NE4-004-005-000 | MARSTELLJOSEPH & KATHLEEN AHS W EIGHTH-ST $799:12 REMOVED - TAXES PAID
139/18-2832 |WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 1 |68-P12NW2-005-016-000 |(PIERRE LOUIS EDDY & MARIE D 223 TOWANDA ST $2,023.08 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
140/19-2870 |WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 2 |68-P12NW1-023-005-000 |KINNEY JOSEPH M, deceased 306 BERWICK ST $1,959.71 SOLD $32,000 BIDDER # 379
141|18-3001 | HAZLETON-CHY-WARD-S A-U8-101-134-880 PEREZ FRANCISCOJ & NELSIDA-GARCIA DUARTE 134 S PINE-TREERD $858.59 REMOVED - COURT ORDER
142|16-2471 | HAZLETON-CHY WARD-8 A-T8SW42-001-008-0080 |VUECETOVUECGANHA-&ABAMLIZBINSKI-deceased 328 W-BROAD-ST $4,427.38 REMOVED - TRUMP BID BY HAZLETON LAND BANK
143(20-2880 |HAZLETON CITY WARD 11 71-T8NW44-011-01B-000 |ROSSIJOHN T 828 W 7TH ST $1,761.96 SOLD $42,000 BIDDER # 303
144(16-2511 |HAZLETON CITY WARD 11 71-T8SW11-011-04C-000 |ARNDT, SALLY A 551 HANOVER CT $3,092.09 SOLD $42,000 BIDDER # 48
145(20-3006 |HAZLETON CITY WARD 15 71-U8NW31-011-31B-000 |CASTILLO EDWIN 321 E CARLTON AVE $1,870.54 SOLD $12,500 BIDDER # 387
146(13-3434 |PITTSTON CITY WARD 1 72-D11SE2-001-022-000 GERMAN, ANDREW, deceased & LIZZIE, deceased 108 CLIFF ST $2,999.52 SOLD $16,500 BIDDER # 477
147|19-3259 RHISTON-GITY-WARD6 72-E11NE3-032-001-000 | ZERBLASJOSEPH & WENDY 160 BUTLER ST $2,772.69 REMOVED - TRUMP BID BY NEPA LAND BANK
148(20-3085 |PITTSTON CITY WARD 6 72-E11NE3-032-010-000 MORGAN JOHN G & DOREEN 184 BUTLER ST $1,185.67 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
149|28-3079 RHISTON-GIYWARD6 72-E1INE3-020-021-000 |WHIPRPLEWENDY 172 CARROLLST $1,710-28 REMOVED - TRUMP BID BY NEPA LAND BANK
150{20-3104 |PITTSTON CITY WARD 10 72-E11SE1-030-020-000 ORTH RICHARD J & JACQUELINE 8 E OAK ST $1,456.64 SOLD $29,000 BIDDER # 464
151(18-3329 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 1 73-H10NW2-018-026-000 |VIEW JOLEEN 3 AUBURN ST $2,102.79 SOLD $2,500 BIDDER # 478
152(17-3334 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 1 73-H10NW4-016-026-000 |[GURCHAK EDWARD J, deceased & FLORENCE L 132 ADJ COURT $1,699.27 SOLD $17,500 BIDDER # 434
153(18-3323 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 1 73-H10NW1-006-012-000 |THOMAS RICHARD C 42 W HOLLENBACK ST $1,558.64 SOLD $14,500 BIDDER # 443
154(20-3192 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 2 73-H10SW2-017-014-000 |SHOW BRYAN & KRISTIE 31 SCHOOLHOUSE LN $1,401.45 SOLD $14,500 BIDDER # 177
155(20-3193 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 2 73-H10SW2-017-015-000 |SHOW BRYAN & KRISTIE 33 SCHOOLHOUSE LN $1,318.15 SOLD $1,318.15 # 314
156|1A-3520 |WHLKES-BARREWARD3 73-H105\W/4-008-034-000 |GREEN-THFFANY-E F6-78-EMPIREST $3,003.98 REMOVED - TAXES PAID
157|19-3392 | WHLKES-BARREWARD3 73-H105W/4-006-052-000 |DROZDA-GERALD 50-N-MEADEST $2,152.86 REMOVED - COURT ORDER
158(19-3428 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 6 73-H10SW4-010-034-000 |AMERICAN NOTE WAREHOUSE 37 S FULTON ST $1,923.22 SOLD $18,000 BIDDER # 209
159(18-3424 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 6 73-H10SW4-011-013-000 |MITCHELL, JACK & THERESA 61S. SHERMAN ST $2,778.09 SOLD $65,000 BIDDER # 479
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160(19-3442 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 6 73-110NW1-002-011-000 |PERRY LORI 33 S MEADE ST $2,080.18 SOLD $31,000 BIDDER # 152
161|16-2883 | WHLKES-BARREWARD 9 73-HONW1-021-022-000 |SCHWARZWALDER CURT-W 112 S MEADEST $2,991.86 REMOVED - TAXES PAID
162(18-3493 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 9 73-19NE2-005-045-000 GRANT BRANDEAUX 58-60 WAYNE LN $2,079.63 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
163(17-3476 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 10 73-H9SE1-005-016-000 MOSES PETER, deceased & JEAN, deceased UX 47-49 TERRACE ST $4,926.63 SOLD $63,000 BIDDER # 40
164|19-3517 | MHLKES-BARREWARD-10 73-H9SE1-015-010-000 REESE-ROXZANN 34 W-ACADEMY-ST $2,261:30 REMOVED - TAXES PAID
165(18-3508 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 10 73-H9SE4-006-001-000 ACOSTA DANIEL & SUSAN GARCIA 219 ACADEMY ST $3,159.41 SOLD $69,000 BIDDER # 143
166(17-3545 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 12 73-H9SE4-033-004-000 CRUZ CHERIE L 42-44 MONROE ST $2,787.64 SOLD $27,500 BIDDER # 236
167(18-3601 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 73-19NE1-028-002-000 KUNCEWICZ LEA B 51-53 PROSPECT ST $1,760.51 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
168(20-3417 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 73-19NE2 -006-002-000 DAVIS JAMAEL | 311 ESOUTH ST $1,931.17 SOLD $9,500 BIDDER # 458
169(19-3660 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 73-19NE2 -046-004-000 ABDUL-MAJEED AKRAM M 36 HUTSON ST $1,661.28 SOLD $27,000 BIDDER # 391
170{19-3634 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 73-19NE2 -022-032-000 BABB MELVIN, deceased & ESTHER A ROTHMAN 110 LEHIGH ST $2,063.15 SOLD $51,000 BIDDER # 320
171{18-3602 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 73-19NE1-028-004-000 KUNCEWICZ LEA B PROSPECT ST $1,873.20 SOLD $4,500 BIDDER # 274
172(18-3731 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 13 73-19NE4-035-001-000 KUNCEWICZ LEA B 240-242 BROWN ST $1,782.83 SOLD $36,000 BIDDER # 414
173|19-3713 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 14 73-19NE4-011-013-000 HUGHES, JENNIE M, deceased & CLIFFORD, deceased 236 LUZERNE ST $2,452.71 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
174/19-3705 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 14 73-19NE3-029-026-000 MURGAL, REBECCAJ BLACKMAN ST $1,699.87 SOLD $1,699.87 BIDDER # 363
175/18-3727 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 14 73-19NE4-032-019-000 KUNCEWICZ LEA B 284 BLACKMAN ST $2,355.09 SOLD $34,000 BIDDER # 25
176/18-3747 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 14 73-19SE2-004-024-000 JONES MARY A 42 NICHOLSON ST $2,727.18 SOLD $58,000 BIDDER#1
177/19-3699 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 14 73-19NE3-021-022-000 PENNINGTON BRIAN & DAVID ATKINSON 29 ESSEX LN $1,121.09 SOLD $35,000 BIDDER # 251
178/19-3804 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 15 73-19NW2 -006-005-000 REED ROBYN L 51 CARLISLE ST $2,731.50 SOLD $44,000 BIDDER # 483
179|20-3602 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 15 73-19NE1 -021-015-000 HUGHES JOHN R & ROBIN 67 OREGON ST $2,337.54 SOLD $43,000 BIDDER # 312
180/18-3751 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 15 73-H9SE4-016-027-000 ROYAL MAINTENANCES, INC. 114 WOOD ST. ON CORNER OF WESTMINSTER $2,577.29 SOLD $54,000 BIDDER # 225
181|18-3796 |WHLKES-BARREWARD1S5 Z3-19NA2-088-025-000 LAURORE-MAXIS-&-GUERLINEL 169-HORTON-ST $2,447.54 REMOVED - COURT ORDER
182(19-3786 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 15 73-H9SW3 -040-029-000 |LAURENT JOYCELINE & SANDRA EUGENE 31 LAWRENCE ST $2,608.48 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
183(19-3859 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 16 73-H10NW2-020-033-000 |BAUT JACOB S 7 CHASE LN $1,814.51 SOLD $15,000 BIDDER # 357
184(11-3297 WILKES-BARRE WARD 16 73-H10SW1-006-032-000 |GILDEA JOHN PATRICK 282 N PENNSYLVANIA AVE $3,413.14 SOLD $16,000 BIDDER # 227
185(20-3764 |WILKES-BARRE WARD 20 73-G10SE3-004-009-000 KONDRATICK BRIDGETT & ROBERT 1354 SCOTT ST $2,241.09 SOLD $16,500 BIDDER # 301
186(19-4001 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-D6 -00A-02A-020 SCHULTZ FRED B & MARION E 75 OLD LAKE RD $3,276.35 SOLD $11,500 BIDDER # 312
187(20-3808 |HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-D654 -007-030-000 BROVERO WILLIAM DUDLEY ST $1,564.83 SOLD $4,500 BIDDER # 253
188(20-3812 |HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-D654 -020-005-000 GENOVESE NANCY 2 NOBLE ST $1,462.63 SOLD $24,500 BIDDER # 203
189(20-3794 | HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-D6 -00A-021-000 HAMIDY IBRAHIM ADJ ADAMSON-LAKE ROAD $1,288.00 SOLD $2,500 BIDDER # 486
190/20-3820 |HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-D7S10 -004-11A-000 KRIEL JOHN & JULIA CASTERLINE RD $1,569.33 SOLD $2,500 BIDDER # 431
191{20-3790 |HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-C657 -001-005-109 PENDER GERALD 6 HANSONS LANDING $1,660.78 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
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192 O/HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-D6S2 -011-038-000 ROBERTS CHRISTINE & PAMELA SCOTT BEECH ST $1,392.95 SOLD $3,000 BIDDER # 346
193(20-3789 |HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-C657 -001-005-098 SCHNEIDER KEVIN 109 CARDINAL LN $1,568.77 SOLD $3,000 BIDDER 317
194(19-4037 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-D7S6 -003-020-000 RIFKIN LAZARUS, deceased & BECCA, deceased REAR CARPENTER RD $1,514.32 NO BID - OFF TO RESPOSITORY
195(19-4036 |HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-D7S6 -003-012-000 RIFKIN LAZARUS, deceased & BECCA, deceased REAR CARPENTER RD $1,758.76 SOLD $1,758.76 BIDDER #253
196(19-4020 HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-D654 -021-001-000 ROCHAEWICZ MICHAEL 225 BROOK ST $2,309.41 SOLD $32,0000 BIDDER # 312
197(20-3811 |HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-D654 -020-003-000 DAVIS WILLIAM R & JUDITH 222 NOBLE ST $1,637.09 SOLD $20,500 BIDDER # 203
198(20-3814 |HARVEYS LAKE BORO 74-D6S5 -003-006-000 WYNNE JOSEPH & CATHY TROLLEY HL $1,299.01 FAILED TO PAY - OFF TO REPOSITORY
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